1201 025 (1001)		0200	I	i I		1 1
PROPOSAL FOR: TIME & DATE:	SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM P. O. BOX 2449 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 TABULATION OF BIDS Annual Contract for Automotive & Light Truck Brake Parts (June 1, 2017 through May 31, 2018) 3:00 p.m., April 10, 2017		Genuine Parts Co. 6374 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 78218	O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	Southwest Wheel	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Gen1 6374 San	OT db; 23; Spi	Sol	
GROUP 1	MASTER CYLINDERS AND REPAIR KITS					
1.	Percent of discount offered		30%			
2.	Product indentification (Mfg.)		NAPA Cardone			
3.	Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Jobber			
4.	Price schedule number					
5.	Date of price schedule		2016			
6.	Price schedule column on which discount is based (I.e., distributor, jobber, dealer)		Jobber	TED		
1.	5 ea. Master Cylinder, NAPA, Vendor #M3643, SAWS #34385 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR	94.92 474.60 NAPA M3643	BID NOT TABULATED NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
2.	5 ea. Master Cylinder, NAPA, Vendor #M3435, SAWS #34386 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR	36.53 182.65 NAPA M3435	D NOT .	ž	
3.	5 ea. Master Cylinder, NAPA, Vendor #M3635, SAWS #34387 Manufacturer and Part # being bid 5 ea.	PRICE TOTAL MFR PRICE	75.27 376.35 NAPA M3635 56.16	B		
4.	Master Cylinder, NAPA, Vendor #M3509, SAWS #34388 Manufacturer and Part # being bid 5 ea.	TOTAL MFR PRICE	280.80 NAPA M3509 97.73			
5.	Master Cylinder, NAPA, Vendor #M4949 Manufacturer and Part # being bid 5 ea.	TOTAL MFR PRICE	488.65 NAPA M4949 97.73			
6.	Master Cylinder, NAPA, Vendor #M4338 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	TOTAL MFR	97.75 488.65 NAPA M4949			
GROUP 2	TOTAL GROUP 1 WHEEL CYLINDERS AND REPAIR KITS	TOTAL	2,291.70			
1.	Percent of discount offered		25%			

PROPOSAL FOR: TIME & DATE: ITEM NO.	SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM P. O. BOX 2449 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 TABULATION OF BIDS Annual Contract for Automotive & Light Truck Brake Parts (June 1, 2017 through May 31, 2018) 3:00 p.m., April 10, 2017 DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Genuine Parts Co. 6374 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 78218	O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	Southwest Wheel	
2.	Product indentification (Mfg.)		NAPA			
3.	Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Jobber			
4.	Price schedule number			<u> </u>		
5.	Date of price schedule		2016			
6.	Price schedule column on which discount is based (I.e., distributor, jobber, dealer)		Jobber	ED		
1.	8 ea. Wheel Cylinder, United, Vendor #370180, SAWS #34389 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR	12.16 97.28 United 370180	ABULAT	BID	
2.	8 ea. Wheel Cylinder, United, Vendor #37400, SAWS #34392 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR	5.36 42.88 United 37400	BID NOT TABULATED NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
CDOUD 2	TOTAL GROUP 2	TOTAL	140.16	BII		
GROUP 3 1.	BRAKE HOSES AND RELATED ITEMS Percent of discount offered		25%			
1.	1 Geom of discount official		2370	1		
2.	Product indentification (Mfg.)		NAPA			
3.	Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Jobber			
4.	Price schedule number					

PROPOSAL FOR: TIME & DATE:	SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM P. O. BOX 2449 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 TABULATION OF BIDS Annual Contract for Automotive & Light Truck Brake Parts (June 1, 2017 through May 31, 2018) 3:00 p.m., April 10, 2017		Genuine Parts Co. 6374 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 78218	O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	Southwest Wheel	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		0 6 8	N 2 & C	δ	
5.	Date of price schedule		2016			
6.	Price schedule column on which discount is based (I.e., distributor, jobber, dealer)		Jobber			
1.	12 ea. Brake Hose, United, Vendor #381513 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR	14.15 169.80 United 381513			
2.	12 ea. Brake Hose, United, Vendor #381513 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR	14.15 169.80 United 381513			
3.	8 ea. Brake Hose, United, Vendor #381169 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR	7.92 63.36 United 381169			
4.	8 ea. Brake Hose, United, Vendor #381184 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR	9.54 76.32 United 381184	ULATEL	Q	
5.	10 ea. Brake Hose, United, Vendor #682846 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR	13.92 139.20 United 682846	BID NOT TABULATED NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
6.	10 ea. Brake Hose, United, Vendor #682458 Manufacturer and Part # being bid 10 ea.	PRICE TOTAL MFR PRICE	10.87 108.70 United 682458 9.88	BID		
7.	Brake Hose, United, Vendor #381134 Manufacturer and Part # being bid 10 ea.	TOTAL MFR PRICE	98.80 United 381134 8.83			
8.	Brake Hose, United, Vendor #381135 Manufacturer and Part # being bid 10 ea.	TOTAL MFR PRICE	88.30 United 381135			
9.	Brake Hose, United, Vendor #UP609788 Manufacturer and Part # being bid 10 ea.	TOTAL MFR PRICE	109.40 United 609788 10.94			
10.	Brake Hose, United, Vendor #UP609789 Manufacturer and Part # being bid 10 ea.	TOTAL MFR PRICE	109.40 United 609789 9.31			
11.	Brake Hose, United, Vendor #UP609776 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	TOTAL MFR	93.10 United 609776			

F281-629 (Rev.	5/92)	17-0283				
	SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM P. O. BOX 2449 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 TABULATION OF BIDS		Co. Rd. 'X 78218	O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	lee	
PROPOSAL FOR: TIME & DATE:	Annual Contract for Automotive & Light Truck Brake Parts (June 1, 2017 through May 31, 2018) 3:00 p.m., April 10, 2017		Genuine Parts Co. 6374 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 78	O'Reilly Auto Enterpriss dba O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	Southwest Wheel	
12.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY 10 ea. Brake Hose, United, Vendor #UP609779 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR	9.31 93.10 United 609779	<u> </u>	, v	
12.	TOTAL GROUP 3	TOTAL	1,319.28	ED 3	NO BID	
GROUP 4 1.	LOADED AND UNLOADED CALIPERS & REPAIR KITS Percent of discount offered		25%			
2.	Product indentification (Mfg.)		NAPA Cardone			
3.	Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Jobber			
4.	Price schedule number			BID NOT TABULATED NON-RESPONSIVE		
5.	Date of price schedule		2016	ID NOT 1 NON-RE	N	
6.	Price schedule column on which discount is based (I.e., distributor, jobber, dealer)		Jobber) B		
1.	8 ea. Unloaded Clipers, Cardone, Vendor #SE5469 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR	42.18 337.44 Cardone SE5469			
2.	8 ea. Unloaded Clipers, Cardone, Vendor #SE5470 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR	42.18 337.44 Cardone SE5470			
3.	10 ea. Loader Clipers, Cardone, Vendor #LE5469 Manufacturer and Part # being bid 10 ea.	PRICE TOTAL MFR PRICE	69.60 696.00 Cardone LE5469 69.60			
4.	Loaded Clipers, United, Vendor #LE5470 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	TOTAL MFR	69.60 696.00 Cardone LE5470			

F281-629 (Rev.	. 5/92)	17-0283	•	1	1		
PROPOSAL FOR: TIME & DATE: ITEM NO.	SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM P. O. BOX 2449 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 TABULATION OF BIDS Annual Contract for Automotive & Light Truck Brake Parts (June 1, 2017 through May 31, 2018) 3:00 p.m., April 10, 2017 DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Genuine Parts Co. 6374 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 78218	O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	Southwest Wheel		
5. 6. 7.	12 ea. Loaded Clipers, Cardone, Vendor #LE5309 Manufacturer and Part # being bid 12 ea. Loaded Clipers, Cardone, Vendor #LE5310 Manufacturer and Part # being bid 8 ea. Unloaded Clipers, Cardone, Vendor #SE5788 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR PRICE TOTAL MFR PRICE TOTAL MFR	65.43 785.16 Cardone LE5309 65.43 785.16 Cardone LE5310 58.72 469.76 Cardone SE5788	BID NOT TABULATED NON-RESPONSIVE			
8. GROUP 5	8 ea. Unloaded Clipers, Cardone, Vendor #SE5189 Manufacturer and Part # being bid TOTAL GROUP 4 BRAKE SHOES (LINED), NON ASBESTORS PREMIUM	PRICE TOTAL MFR TOTAL	31.38 251.04 Cardone SE5189 4,358.00		NO BID		
<u>1.</u> <u>2.</u>	Percent of discount offered Product indentification (Mfg.)		25% United NAPA				
3.	Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Jobber				
4.	Price schedule number						
5.	Date of price schedule		2016				
6.	Price schedule column on which discount is based (I.e., distributor, jobber, dealer)		Jobber				

F281-629 (Rev.	5/92)	17-0283		•		
	SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM P. O. BOX 2449 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 TABULATION OF BIDS		78218	O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	_	
PROPOSAL FOR:	Annual Contract for Automotive & Light Truck Brake Parts		Genuine Parts Co. 6374 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 78218	O'Reilly Auto Enterpriss dba O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	Southwest Wheel	
TIME & DATE:	(June 1, 2017 through May 31, 2018) 3:00 p.m., April 10, 2017		anuine 74 Ri n Ant	Reilly a O'R 3 S. P ringfi	uthwe	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY			O.7 db 23 Sp	So	
	8 ea.	PRICE	32.74			
	Brake Soes Lined, United, Vendor #UP961PB	TOTAL	261.92			
<u>1.</u>	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	United UP10961PB			
	10 ea.	PRICE	42.94			
	Brake Shoes Lined, United, Vendor #UP10781P13	TOTAL	429.40			
2.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	United UP10781PB	ı		
	10 ea.	PRICE	50.54			
	Brake Shoes Lined, United, Vendor #UP10855	TOTAL	505.40			
3.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	United UP10855			
	10 ea.	PRICE	27.54			
_	Brake Shoes Lined, United, Vendor #UP10752PB	TOTAL	275.40			
4.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	United UP10752PB			
	8 ea.	PRICE	42.12			
_	Brake Shoes Lined, United, Vendor #UP10920PB	TOTAL	336.96			
5.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	United UP10920PB	E E		
				ULAT		
	TOTAL GROUP 5	TOTAL	1,809.08	\B1\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\		
GROUP 6	DISC BRAKE ROTORS			T/A	NO BID	
1.	Percent of discount offered		20%	BID NOT TABULATED NON-RESPONSIVE	Z	
				BID		
2.	Product indentification (Mfg.)		NAPA			
۷.	r roduct indentification (wifg.)		INAFA			
3.	Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Jobber			
<u>o.</u>	Type of price schedule (dether, jobber, etc.)		300001			
4.	Price schedule number					
				•		
5.	Date of price schedule		2016			
	Price schedule column on which discount is based					
6.	(I.e., distributor, jobber, dealer)		Jobber			

F281-629 (R	ev. 3/92)	17-0283	I	İ	İ	ı
PROPOSAL FOR: TIME & DATE: ITEM NO.	SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM P. O. BOX 2449 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 TABULATION OF BIDS Annual Contract for Automotive & Light Truck Brake Parts (June 1, 2017 through May 31, 2018) 3:00 p.m., April 10, 2017 DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Genuine Parts Co. 6374 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 78218	O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	Southwest Wheel	
1.	24 ea. Disc Brake Rotors, NAPA, Vendor #NB48880898 Manufacturer and Part # being bid 32 ea. Disc Brake Rotors, NAPA, Vendor #NB48880905 Manufacturer and Part # being bid 20 ea.	PRICE TOTAL MFR PRICE TOTAL MFR PRICE	29.34 704.16 NAPA 48880898 36.99 1,183.68 NAPA 48880905 23.70			
3.	Disc Brake Rotors, NAPA, Vendor #NB48880082 Manufacturer and Part # being bid 8 ea. Disc Brake Rotors, NAPA, Vendor #NB48880036 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	TOTAL MFR PRICE TOTAL MFR	474.00 NAPA 4880082 20.43 163.44 NAPA 4880036			
5.	14 ea. Disc Brake Rotors, NAPA, Vendor #NB48880182 Manufacturer and Part # being bid 16 ea.	PRICE TOTAL MFR PRICE	24.27 339.78 NAPA 48880182 57.04	.ATED		
6.	Disc Brake Rotors, NAPA, Vendor #NB48880640 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	TOTAL MFR	912.64 NAPA 48880640	TABUI	NO BID	
7.	16 ea. Disc Brake Rotors, NAPA, Vendor #NB48880540 Manufacturer and Part # being bid 24 ea. Disc Brake Rotors, NAPA, Vendor #NB48880508	PRICE TOTAL MFR PRICE TOTAL	29.48 471.68 NAPA 48880540 48.53 1,164.72	BID NOT TABULATED NON-RESPONSIVE	Ž	
8.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid 28 ea.	MFR PRICE	NAPA 48880508 32.20			
9.	Disc Brake Rotors, NAPA, Vendor #NB48880279 Manufacturer and Part # being bid 20 ea. Disc Brake Rotors, NAPA, Vendor #NB48881032	TOTAL MFR PRICE TOTAL	901.60 NAPA 48880279 42.83 856.60			
10.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid 20 ea. Disc Brake Rotors, NAPA, Vendor #NB48880073	MFR PRICE TOTAL	NAPA 48881032 27.10 542.00			
11.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA 48880073			
	TOTAL GROUP 6	TOTAL	7,714.30			

F281-629 (Rev.	5/92)	17-0283		•	1	
	SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM P. O. BOX 2449 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 TABULATION OF BIDS		o. d. 78218	O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	_	
PROPOSAL FOR: TIME & DATE:	Annual Contract for Automotive & Light Truck Brake Parts (June 1, 2017 through May 31, 2018) 3:00 p.m., April 10, 2017		Genuine Parts Co. 6374 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 7	O'Reilly Auto Enterpriss dba O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	Southwest Wheel	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Genu 6374 San	O7 db, 23, Sp	So	
GROUP 7	BRAKE SHOE DISC PADS, NON ASBESTOS PREMIUM					
1.	Percent of discount offered		25%			
2.	Product indentification (Mfg.)		NAPA Brakes			
3.	Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)	_	Jobber			
4.	Price schedule number					
5.	Date of price schedule		2016	ED		
6.	Price schedule column on which discount is based (I.e., distributor, jobber, dealer)		Jobber	BID NOT TABULATED NON-RESPONSIVE	310	
				TA	NO BID	
	16 ea.	PRICE	31.60 505.60	VOT N-R		
1.	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS7706X Manufacturer and Part # being bid	TOTAL MFR	NAPA SS7706X	NON NO		
	16 ea.	PRICE	23.41	IB B		
	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS7944BX	TOTAL	374.56			
2.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS7944BX			
	8 ea.	PRICE	32.77			
	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS7662X	TOTAL	262.16			
3.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS7662X			
	16 ea.	PRICE	29.27			
4	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS8390M	TOTAL	468.32			
4.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS8390M			
	16 ea. Proka Pada NAPA Vandar #\$\$7653V	PRICE	35.11 561.76			
5	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS7652X	TOTAL	561.76			
5.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid 7 ea.	MFR PRICE	NAPA SS7652X 32.77	+		
	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS7653X	TOTAL	229.39			
6.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS7653X			
<u>U.</u>	International and I are # Ooning Old	IVIT. IX	11/11 Y 29/032V			

F281-629 (Re	ev. 5/92)	17-0283		į	•	
	SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM P. O. BOX 2449 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 TABULATION OF BIDS		o. .d. K 78218	O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	21	
PROPOSAL FOR: TIME & DATE:	Annual Contract for Automotive & Light Truck Brake Parts (June 1, 2017 through May 31, 2018) 3:00 p.m., April 10, 2017		Genuine Parts Co. 6374 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 78	O'Reilly Auto Enterprises dba O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	Southwest Wheel	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY 16 ea.	PRICE	25.74	O B 23 80	Ň	
7.	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS7915M Manufacturer and Part # being bid	TOTAL MFR	23.74 411.84 SS7915M			
	30 ea.	PRICE	38.05			
	Premium Grade Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #UP7972M	TOTAL	1,141.50			
8.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS7972M	ļ		
	20 ea.	PRICE	35.11			
	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS7706X	TOTAL	702.20			
9.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS8389X			
	20 ea.	PRICE	35.11			
10	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS8528X	TOTAL	702.20			
10.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid 22 ea.	MFR PRICE	NAPA SS8528X 25.75	ļ		
	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS7991M	TOTAL	566.50			
11.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS7991M	A .		
	22 ea.	PRICE	25.75	BID NOT TABULATED NON-RESPONSIVE		
	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS7867M	TOTAL	566.50	NSI		
12.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS7867M	BT.	NO BID	
-	22 ea.	PRICE	29.27	TA	0 10	
	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS8390M	TOTAL	643.94	OT I-R	Z	
13.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS8390M	Ž O		
	22 ea.	PRICE	33.36			
	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS7973BM	TOTAL	733.92			
14.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS7973BM			
	22 ea.	PRICE	31.60			
	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS7706X	TOTAL	695.20			
15.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS7706X	ļ		
	22 ea.	PRICE	32.77			
	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS7997X	TOTAL	720.94			
16.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS7997X			
	10 ea.	PRICE	32.77			
	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS8529X	TOTAL	327.70			
17.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS8529X			
	10 ea.	PRICE	35.11			
40	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS8472X	TOTAL	351.10			
18.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS8472X			

F281-629 (Re	vv. 5/92)	17-0283				
	SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM P. O. BOX 2449 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 TABULATION OF BIDS		78218	terprises, LLC o Parts 65802	_	
PROPOSAL FOR: TIME & DATE: ITEM NO.	Annual Contract for Automotive & Light Truck Brake Parts (June 1, 2017 through May 31, 2018) 3:00 p.m., April 10, 2017 DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Genuine Parts Co. 6374 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 7	O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	Southwest Wheel	
	10 ea.	PRICE	25.75	0 0 ((0,		
19.	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS7974M Manufacturer and Part # being bid	TOTAL MFR	257.50 NAPA SS7974M			
	10 ea. Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #UP7973BM	PRICE TOTAL	33.36 333.60			
20.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS7973BM			
	10 ea.	PRICE	29.26	·		
	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS8312X	TOTAL	292.60			
21.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS8312X			
	8 ea.	PRICE	33.36			
	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #UP7974AM	TOTAL	266.88			
22.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS7974AM			
	16 ea.	PRICE	23.41			
00	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS7944BX	TOTAL	374.56			
23.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS7944BX	_		
	10 ea. Droke Pede NADA Vender #SS7074AM	PRICE	33.36 333.60	E ED		
24.	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS7974AM Manufacturer and Part # being bid	TOTAL MFR	NAPA SS7974AM	ID NOT TABULATED NON-RESPONSIVE		
<u> 24.</u>	16 ea.	PRICE	35.11	UL NS NS		
	Premium Grade Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #UP8472X	TOTAL	561.76	AB PC	NO BID	
25.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS8472X		9	
20.	30 ea.	PRICE	31.60	ID NOT NON-R		
	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS7877X	TOTAL	948.00	Z Q		
26.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS7877X	BI 1		
	30 ea.	PRICE	47.68	•		
	Fleet Grade Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #FT8472	TOTAL	1,430.40			
27.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA FT8472			
	30 ea.	PRICE	45.01			
	Fleet Grade Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #FT8312	TOTAL	1,350.30			
28.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA FT8312			
	30 ea.	PRICE	31.60			
	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS8214X	TOTAL	948.00			
29.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS8214X	•		
	8 ea.	PRICE	31.60			
20	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS8214X	TOTAL	252.80			
30.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS8214X			
	8 ea.	PRICE	38.04			
21	Brake Pads, NAPA, Vendor #SS8268X	TOTAL	304.32			
31.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA SS8268X			

1201 025 (1001.	. 3(72)	17 0200	1	1	I	1
PROPOSAL FOR: TIME & DATE: ITEM NO.	SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM P. O. BOX 2449 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 TABULATION OF BIDS Annual Contract for Automotive & Light Truck Brake Parts (June 1, 2017 through May 31, 2018) 3:00 p.m., April 10, 2017 DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Genuine Parts Co. 6374 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 78218	O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	Southwest Wheel	
GROUP 8	TOTAL GROUP 7 HARDWARE KITS TO CONSIST OF SELF-ADJUSTING KITS; SPRING KITS, HOLD-DOWN KITS, ETC.	TOTAL	17,619.65			
1.	Percent of discount offered		25% United			
3.	Product indentification (Mfg.) Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		NAPA Jobber	ATED SIVE		
<u>4.</u> <u>5.</u>	Price schedule number Date of price schedule		2016	BID NOT TABULATED NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
6.	Price schedule column on which discount is based (I.e., distributor, jobber, dealer) 10 ea.	PRICE	Jobber 5.91	BIG		
1.	Hardware Kit, United, Vendor #83841A Manufacturer and Part # being bid 10 ea. Hardware Kit, United, Vendor #83413A	TOTAL MFR PRICE TOTAL	59.10 United 83841A 8.98 89.80			
2.3.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid 12 ea. Hardware Kit, United, Vendor #3150 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR PRICE TOTAL MFR	United 83413A 10.96 131.52 United 3150			
4.	12 ea. Hardware Kit, United, Vendor #83529A Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR	8.98 143.68 United 83529A			

F281-629 (Rev.	5/92)	17-0283				
	SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM P. O. BOX 2449 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 TABULATION OF BIDS		čo. kd. K 78218	interprises, LLC ito Parts	la	
PROPOSAL FOR: TIME & DATE: ITEM NO.	Annual Contract for Automotive & Light Truck Brake Parts (June 1, 2017 through May 31, 2018) 3:00 p.m., April 10, 2017 DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Genuine Parts Co. 6374 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 77	O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, dba O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	Southwest Wheel	
5.	16 ea. Hardware Kit, United, Vendor #83394A Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR	6.48 103.68 United 83394A			
6.	15 ea. Hardware Kit, United, Vendor #83504A Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR	7.11 106.65 United 83504A			
7.	15 ea. Hardware Kit, United, Vendor #83459A Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR	11.88 178.20 United 83459A			
8.	20 ea. Hardware Kit, United, Vendor #83354A Manufacturer and Part # being bid 20 ea.	PRICE TOTAL MFR PRICE	5.04 100.80 United 83354A 4.68			
9.	Hardware Kit, United, Vendor #83367A Manufacturer and Part # being bid	TOTAL MFR	93.60 United 83367A			
GROUP 9	TOTAL GROUP 8 BRAKE DRUMS	TOTAL	1,007.03	D NOT TABULATED NON-RESPONSIVE	Q	
				ID NOT TABULATE NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
1.	Percent of discount offered		25%	BID I		
2.	Product indentification (Mfg.)		NAPA Brakes			
3.	Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Jobber			
4.	Price schedule number					
5.	Date of price schedule		2016			
6.	Price schedule column on which discount is based (I.e., distributor, jobber, dealer)		Jobber			

PROPOSAL FOR: TIME & DATE: ITEM NO.	SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM P. O. BOX 2449 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 TABULATION OF BIDS Annual Contract for Automotive & Light Truck Brake Parts (June 1, 2017 through May 31, 2018) 3:00 p.m., April 10, 2017 DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Genuine Parts Co. 6374 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 78218	O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	Southwest Wheel	
	8 ea.	PRICE	40.72			
1.	Brake Drums, NAPA, Vendor #440-1815 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	TOTAL MFR	325.76 NAPA 440-1815			
2.	6 ea. Brake Drums, NAPA, Vendor #440-1662 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR	28.23 169.38 NAPA 440-1662			
3.	8 ea. Brake Drums, NAPA, Vendor #440-1477 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR	37.46 299.68 NAPA 440-1477			
4.	6 ea. Brake Drums, NAPA, Vendor #440-1366 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR	34.21 205.26 NAPA 440-1366			
5.	6 ea. Brake Drums, NAPA, Vendor #440-1663 Manufacturer and Part # being bid	PRICE TOTAL MFR	45.06 270.36 NAPA 440-1663			
-				ATED		
GROUP 10	TOTAL GROUP 9 BRAKE WHEEL STUD & NUTS	TOTAL	1,270.44	BID NOT TABULATED NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	
1.	Percent of discount offered		25%	BID NG NON		
2.	Product indentification (Mfg.)		NAPA Dorman			
3.	Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Jobber			
4.	Price schedule number					
5.	Date of price schedule		2016			
6.	Price schedule column on which discount is based (I.e., distributor, jobber, dealer)		Jobber			

PROPOSAL FOR: TIME & DATE: ITEM NO.	SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM P. O. BOX 2449 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 TABULATION OF BIDS Annual Contract for Automotive & Light Truck Brake Parts (June 1, 2017 through May 31, 2018) 3:00 p.m., April 10, 2017 DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Genuine Parts Co. 6374 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 78218	O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts 233 S. Patterson Springfield, MO 65802	Southwest Wheel	
	10 ea.	PRICE	1.12			
	Wheel Nuts, Dorman, Vendor #641-3237	TOTAL	11.20			
1.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	NAPA 641-3237			
	10 ea.	PRICE	1.05			
	Wheel Nuts, Dorman, Vendor #641-2137	TOTAL	10.50			
2.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	Dorman 641-2137			
-	15 ea.	PRICE	0.73			
	Wheel Nuts, Dorman, Vendor #641-4120	TOTAL	10.95	Q		
3.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	Dorman 641-4120	TE]		
	15 ea.	PRICE	1.40	LA		
	Wheel Nuts, Dorman, Vendor #641-1600	TOTAL	21.00	BU		
4.	Manufacturer and Part # being bid	MFR	Dorman 641-1600	TA]	NO BID	
				BID NOT TABULATED NON-RESPONSIVE	ž	
	momit apolypia		#0 4#	NO.		
	TOTAL GROUP 10	TOTAL	53.65	BIS N		
			*			
	TOTAL GROUPS 1-10	TOTAL	37,583.29			
			7:30 a.m			
			8:00 p.m.			
	Business Hours Monday - Friday		5 days/week			
			8:00 a.m			
			6:00 p.m.			
	Business Hours Saturday		Sat. & Sun.			
			2%			
	Terms		2% 10 days			
	Tomo		10 days			
	Delivery Days					

*LOW BIDDER

BIDS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

A&L Automotive
Full Service Auto Parts
Genuine Parts Co.
Gonzalez Auto Parts
Poppe Automotive
Poquito Mas Enterprise
Uni-Select USA, Inc.

SAWS Website